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CON TE X T  

The COVID-19 Pandemic has confronted our global society with a condition 
frequently seen as superseded: that of humanity’s frailty. The enormous technological 
achievements have imparted us with a notion of progress that bestowed on 
humankind a position of near-lordship over the natural world, and nourished a 
generalized perception that solutions of a technical nature could alone hold the key 
for human progress and betterment1. Such self-conscience has proved resilient in face 
of the direst forecasts concerning climate change, and even the boldest past warnings 
of a biological threat such as we are now experiencing. But our common life 
experience over the past months, which has unified the globe in unprecedented ways 
around a common challenge, not only contested such view, but reinforced the 
perception of some fundamental systemic fragilities. The numerous challenges that 
governments and societies are facing in tackling the coronavirus, and the threats that 
the Pandemic has further imposed to globalization and international cooperation, 
clearly show that the role of science as a response to crisis is limited in face of a 
socioeconomic disarrangement that increasingly cripples the potential gains of 
technical action. 

Scientific and technological progress are per se incapable to answer to our common 
global challenges and produce resilient societies for the XXI century. Comparative 
moral and humanitarian progress, which must translate into a renewed 
socioeconomic organization, are necessary2 to: (i) sustain democracies that can 
endure the regular assaults of populism and extremism, (ii) build a fairer capitalism, 
that can guarantee jobs and justly value all kinds of work, thus safeguarding a 
dignifying existence to all citizens, (iii) promote a truly humanist and scientific 
culture that is resilient in face of ideological impositions, and can both respect and 
promote people’s freedom and traditions. 

Despite a reduction of global poverty3, and generally improving international 
cooperation, Western Society was not able to match those developments by a sense of 
responsibility towards others. Growing numbers of people are being excluded from 
the social tapestry, generating resentment from populations and a generalized lack of 
trust in governmental leadership, which is seen as lacking of moral authority4. In fact, 
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the unprecedented levels of social inequality5 are fundamentally incompatible with 
healthy and stable democracies. The Pandemic has further exposed the weaknesses of 
a system where decision-taking and power to act are ever more distant from ordinary 
people and daily life. Entire states find themselves at times effectively subdued 
amidst a perverse dynamic where predatory corporate environments shifts power 
from people and their elected representatives to companies worth more than most 
sovereign states6. 

The current crisis underlines the need of a profound change, and although science 
and technology are not in themselves the solution, they are necessary tools to enable 
it. In particular, information technology (IT) can provide the backbone for a large-
scale reorientation of society that can help preserve the values of freedom, justice, 
communion, and respect for people’s traditions and identity. 

WHA T SHO UL D CHA N GE ?  

As globalization took human movements and exchanges to an unprecedented scale, 
as economic liberalism and internationalization changed the dynamics of the 
productive systems, thwarting the relation between people’s income and real 
economy, and as populations grew to consume resources at unsustainable levels, a 
new fundamental organization of life has become necessary, if we are to build a 
resilient society, lest it be imposed on us by future calamities. 

It is recognized that globalization contributes to global growth and development. At 
the same time, the detachment of supply chains and financial markets from the local 
economy are a central cause of alienation for growing numbers of populations. Large 
segments of the low-income population are not integrated into the global market 
economy and do not benefit from it7. The solution will likely depend on a greater 
valorization of the person as opposed to its economic utility8. 

The building of a new humanism9 must be based on a socioeconomic structure where 
people find the opportunity for an integral development10. Such structure should 
emphasize the identity of the person, both at the smallest scale, strengthening 
families and cultural groups, as well as at national level, where cultural identity and 
tradition are preserved. These are not in opposition to movements of global 
integration and cooperation, but rather offer the proper humanist balance to it. 
Strong communities can effectively equilibrate some of the potentially disintegrating 
forces of globalization whereas making the entire process of socioeconomic 
integration more resilient. We argue that the construction of such communities needs 
a concrete re-organization of the space and an integral ecology10 that creates more 
resilient societies in face of future crisis. 

A V I SI ON F OR TH E F U TUR E  

A new organization of space based in widespread, local communities, nucleated with 
the help of technology and virtual interconnectivity, and which partially reverses the 



current trend towards mega-densification of urban centres, may be a key element in 
creating sustainable societies11. In this context, the virtual sphere can effectively 
preserve the essential aspects of the dynamism of current cities, while responding to 
some of its greatest challenges, such as slum populations, marginalization, violence 
and inequality, etc. 

COVID-19 has shown that global integration is possible through virtual channels, as 
well as productive work and learning, and here resides an opportunity for a large-
scale re-thinking of the organization of socioeconomic structures. Advanced 
production systems based on industry 4.0 and IT should be exploited to the largest 
possible extent to provide a true and effective global network of local realities which 
could help counter some of the imbalances of globalization, promote better ecological 
integration of societies, while keeping people connected within a desirable common 
background of cultural exchange and global integration. 

The strengthening of small communities could be achieved through a sustained 
decentralization of populations throughout the territories. Local realities provide the 
opportunity for a re-emergence of the small-scale economy which has been strangled 
by global markets and also gives the opportunity to preserve region-specific activities, 
which are an important cultural element. The rise of teleworking for education and 
culture provided by the internet means that such local communities can be 
completely integrated to the larger production system, so that economic resources 
from specialized employment as well as advanced learning can be brought in more 
naturally. The cost of life is made cheaper for all, thus allowing for a higher standard 
of living and higher employability. 

This model could have an impact in rebuilding the endangered humanism of our 
depersonalized society by guaranteeing important values of community life, stronger 
family bonds, and the preservation of traditions and cultural identity. These are social 
qualities that help forming individuals with better conscience of belonging, of place 
and self, which in turn builds character and creates citizenship12, reinforcing freedom 
and democracy against populism and ideology13. 

Such communities could not prescind from the support of realities such as churches 
and religious institutions, as well as other organizations. The geographical shift, 
nevertheless, must reshape the structure of work, consumption and social 
organization and will likely depend on joint action by states and companies which act 
as catalysts. The proposed scheme emphasizes the importance and role of the virtual 
sphere in future society, a trend that cannot be reversed, but should be better 
oriented for the common good. 
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